W 4. €1.ua.- 33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

13031, Tel.-37.-13012020-215381
CG-DL-E-13012020-215381

AATYTIOT
EXTRAORDINARY
T [I—9vS 3—S9-99% (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)
AR & YT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

€. 20] 7% feeet, e, s9adt 10, 2020/419 20, 1941
No. 20] NEW DELHI, FRIDAY, JANUARY 10, 2020/PAUSHA 20, 1941

CILISELICE R E D]

FfergEeT
T feedtt, 7 ST9a<T, 2020

araL[. 22(sn).—fF argEe Faw, 1937 7 i o gerge Fe & o wfaea et @
TTET ATATE AT, 1934 (1934 T 22) &l a7 14 H ATATAR AT TR, AW @7
AT it A 17 [dew, 2019 fi srfdeg==r @ 9%,/ 680(31) ¥ T AT F TSI, AT,
qAWT 11, G 3, 39-8T (i) § wanrierd fovu o, S v ot satrat oer 9@ sarfag g i Ssma=r 2,
q o= # =0 AfSHAT F TR I F 9 fam fF srafy & awfy § @ g o gEme awita
A U AL F A9 ¥ TTAaT AT & F STl FITS T

ST Ffoh S ATILAAT § TeRTTq 19 i Tierai faqth 21 [Fdaw, 2019 Fr drastis &9 7
SIS LT &l TS o

3 i fafATde s@fer & siex s M=l & Frad a1 | 916 e ™ a1 GAE! 02 66 986N
3 3ha &9 7 fTEw AT g,

A, A, FAA TRIT, AATT ATAFTH 1934 (1934 FT 22) Fl 9T 5 FRT Y& Ti<hal &l
TART H3d g0, ATATT (H9H, 1937 | ¥ &R0 Hereg v o (o Meafortaa fF=w a9 g, srofia:-

203 GI/2020 (1)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

1. GfErE A iR RH.—(1) =9 F=Ht & "ier 9| argae (q99 "aaree) =, 2020 2
(2) T TR TSI | THT9 FT ATEE T TG g
2. A A9, 1937 it sqg=T 1 H,--
(F) dAIARTTH, T 1 8, @< (3) H,-
“Forae & 150 =21 & I=IH FT ISF HIA qaad! a1ig A § AT el & faaT 6 S
(F) ST-EE (i) H,-
(D) 3= “500” F TITH g 3iF “250” 1 Tiawaniua frar srom)
(I1) 3%k “200” F T 92 3k “100” =7 Ffawariog BT s
(@) 39-E< (i) H 3 F “1000” F forw s “500” giaearioq grm;
@M IT-EE (iv) § 3iF “100” F forw i 75" wiaerfog g,
(7 IT-"EE (v) #F 10" % forw 207 wiaeertaa gom,
(@) TN () § T 1 H, T (3) |-
(F) o=zt “RrEH & 100 et & Svg7 FT IS FIA TEIATHT I1g 19 § R &l e g & s
(@) 9T (F), F 3T-8E (v) T i “10” F foru siw “15” wiaeanfua grm
[®T. /. Td1-11012/4/2018-1]

froqur ;a1 e, srferg=mT e -26 famiw 23 W, 1937 1T AR % 99 ® YT R
F Tz Ay emre AT FLA. 579(37) w9 swra, 2019 gy foFam ra o wa *
TSI, STLTIOT, AT 11, G 3, 39-w< (i) H oA 20 2mreq, 2019 v wrforg forar

MINISTRY OF CIVIL AVIATION
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 7th January, 2020

G.S.R. 22(E).—Whereas, the draft of certain rules further to amend the Aircraft Rules, 1937, was
published as required by section 14 of the Aircraft Act, 1934 (22 of 1934), vide notification of the
Government of India in the Ministry of Civil Aviation, number G.S.R. 680(E), dated the 17th September,
2019, in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i), inviting objections and
suggestions from all persons likely to be affected thereby, before the expiry of a period of thirty days
from the date on which copies of the Gazette of India in which the said notification was published were
made available to public;

And whereas, copies of the Gazette containing the said notification were made available to the
public on the 21st September, 2019;

And whereas, the objections and suggestions received from the public in respect of the draft rules
within the period specified have been duly considered by the Central Government;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by section 5 of the Aircraft Act, 1934 (22 of
1934) the Central Government hereby makes the following rules further to amend the Aircraft Rules,
1937, namely: —



[@TT [I-ET€ 3(1)] HT #hT T[STTS ; STATETLOT 3

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) These rules may be called the Aircraft (First Amendment)
Rules, 2020.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.
2. In the Aircraft Rules, 1937, in Schedule II, —
(A) in Section M, in paragraph 1, in clause (e), —

(a) the words “of which not less than one hundred fifty hours flight time shall be in the
preceding twelve months” shall be omitted;

(b) in sub-clause (i), —

(D for the words “five hundred”, the words “two hundred and fifty” shall be
substituted;

(IT) for the words “two hundred”, the words “one hundred” shall be substituted;

(¢) in sub-clause (ii), for the words “one thousand”, the words “five hundred” shall be
substituted;

(d) in sub-clause (iv), for the words “one hundred”, the words “seventy five” shall be
substituted;

(e) in sub-clause (v), for the word “ten”, the word “twenty” shall be substituted;
(B) in Section N, in paragraph 1, in clause (e), —

(a) the words “of which not less than one hundred hours shall be in the preceding twelve
months” shall be omitted;

(b) in sub-clause (v), for the word “ten”, the word “fifteen” shall be substituted.
[F. No. AV-11012/4/2018-A]
ANGSHUMALI RASTOGI, Jt. Secy.

Note: The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, vide notification number V-26, dated the
23" March, 1937 and last amended vide G.S.R. 579(E), dated the g August, 2019 published in the
Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i) dated the 20" August, 2019.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.



