I Ho o TA0-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

The Gazette of India

STHTEIRUT
EXTRAORDINARY
9T [I—EUS 3—3U-WUE (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

YRR & TehriyTe
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

W, 555] ¢ faoett, wifar, faawr 21, 201991 30, 1941
No. 555] NEW DELHI, SATURDAY, SEPTEMBER 21, 2019/BHADRA 30, 1941

AR fAmmEe s e

FfgET
T foeett, 17 faraw, 2019

q1.#1.13. 680(37).—Faux FawT &1 Muteiad T ™ed HFdT 9w, argame arg=as, 1937
(1934 T 22) ¥ gTT-5 F FIT Ta ATFIT FT TIRT Fd gU AT F92H, 1937 § 30T Y Foirerd e &7
EaTa wT B, oA 3<% atefFee i arr-14 i srergEe 0w st f serh F oo, e e

TATT BT T HATAAT &, TR THAT SFTAT § T TAZaTT AT &f STl g & 91 o o0 § THIea
srferg=aT Y 7=t #r grastfas €9 F ey #0 S f ae § g fam A oeafd F gera 3w e
e o2 A= R s,

fs FE Ay A1 AT B AT TH FEIHGF AN @G99, TRES gaTE Ag % AT,
7% feoeft-110003 =1 9= AT dgoffice@dgca. nic.in T¥ -8 <

3 FfafEe srafd  awme 2F & 1@ S5 ey Faet % araq =fs G =t & w8 a9 g
ITH ZIaT g, a7 39 U< hald 9T g =1 o S|

&y fAew
1. (1) == g #1 afer qam e (e, Terre) 7w, 2019 2
(2) T TR SIS H THA A A FT TG g
2. FrgaTe fFem, 1937 & =T 1 H,-
(F) AT () &, T 1 ¥, g T H-

4930 GI/2019 (1)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

(F)  “FoEH & 150 =2l # A7 FT IS Had Taad! aiig AT § g Qreai 1 &
et st

@)  ITEE (i) § &F “500” F forU o “250” AT &F “200” F forw &7 “100” wfwfig
g,
(M  I9-wE (i) # s “1000” F forw o “500” giaearrfog grm;
(=)  IT-EE (iv) § &F “100” F forw o “75” gfqenta gem;
()  I9-EE (v) 7 s 107 F forg “20” wiaertug grm;
(@ A () W1 H, &2 (3) H,-

(F) T “FrEd & 100 =27 | FG FT IS FA AT T2 ATE H R0 FT &
[ERUEIL

(F) G (), F 3T-GE (v) § &% “10” F fory oi= “15” wiaetfog gom
[T, W.dY.-11012/4/2018-1]
SterTeRt TEAA, |k A

feoqur: = = arig 23 7T, 1937 # ATSH=AT &, V-26 F G AT & TS | THRTId 3 T 2 3T
ST Fomed a2 ST, 2019 FT T1Ed & TSI, AHTLTI, AR-11, TE-3, ST-TE (i) F T
e 25 S 2019 Fit ar.ar.fA. 9. 468(31) T grer B

MINISTRY OF CIVIL AVIATION
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 17th September, 2019

G.S.R. 680(E).—The following draft of certain rules further to amend the Aircraft Rules, 1937, which the
Central Government proposes to make in exercise of the powers conferred by section 5 of the Aircraft Act, 1934 (22 of
1934), is hereby published as required by section 14 of the said Act, for information of all persons likely to be affected
thereby; and notice is hereby given that the said draft rules will be taken into consideration after a period of thirty days
from the date on which copies of the Gazette of India, in which this notification is published, are made available to the
public;

Objections or suggestions, if any, may be addressed to the Director-General of Civil Aviation, Opposite
Safdarjung Airport, New Delhi-110003 or mailed to dgoffice.dgca@nic.in;

Any objection or suggestion which may be received from any person with respect to the said draft rules before
the expiry of the period specified above will be considered by the Central Government.

Draft Rules
1. (€))] These rules may be called the Aircraft (...... Amendment) Rules, 2019.
2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.
2. In the Aircraft Rules, 1937, in Schedule II, —

(A) in Section M, in paragraph 1, in clause (e), —

(a) the words “of which not less than one hundred fifty hours flight time shall be in the preceding
twelve months” shall be omitted;



[ 9T [I-&v€ 3(i)] R T TSI : STHIET 3

(b) in sub-clause (i), for the words “five hundred”, the words “two hundred and fifty” and for the
words “two hundred”, the words “one hundred” shall be substituted;

(c) in sub-clause (ii), for the words “one thousand”, the words “five hundred” shall be substituted;
(d) in sub-clause (iv), for the words “one hundred”, the words “seventy five” shall be substituted;
(e) in sub-clause (v), for the word “ten”, the word “twenty” shall be substituted;

(B) in Section N, in paragraph 1, in clause (e), —

(a) the words “of which not less than one hundred hours shall be in the preceding twelve months”
shall be omitted;

(b) in clause (e), in sub-clause (v), for the word “ten”, the word “fifteen” shall be substituted.

[F. No. AV-11012/4/2018-A]
ANGSHUMALI RASTOGTL, Jt. Secy.
Note: The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, vide notification number V-26, dated the

23" March, 1937 and last amended vide G.S.R. 468(E), dated the 25" June, 2019 published in the
Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, Section 3, Sub-Section (i) dated the 2nd g uly, 2019.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.



